
ARTICULATION PROPOSAL
FOR

Spokane Community College

SA Criminal Justice
Spokane Community College

and
Washington State University

Spokane Community College and Washington State University share a common interest in
facilitating the smooth transition of students transferring from Spokane CC to WSU to pursue
a major in Criminal Justice. The information provided here is intended to eliminate
duplication of coursework and better integrate programs to ensure a more efficient pathway
to graduation. The purpose of this advising recommendation is to provide students with the
Criminal Justice degree from Spokane Community College an advantage as transfer students
into the Criminal Justice program at Washington State University. Students who complete
the Spokane Community College Associate in Arts degree (AA) with a 2.5 cumulative grade
point average or higher will be granted Junior standing and certification into the Political
Science department and the Criminal Justice program.

Washington State University accepts up to 73 semester credits (110 quarter credits) of
transfer work from accredited community colleges. Students completing the AA degree with
an emphasis in Criminal Justice from Spokane Community College fulfill the two lower-
division criminal justice core requirements as well as all lower-division General Education
Requirements. In addition, students must satisfy the College of Liberal Arts (CLA)
requirements, including one year of college-level foreign languages or two years of the same
foreign language in high school, and additional science requirements. If students transfer
prior to fulfilling the AA, the courses taken at Spokane CC will be applied to the Washington
State University General Education core and to respective options within the Criminal Justice
program based on Transfer Course Equivalency guidelines. Please visit the following Web
site for more specific information <www.wsu.edu/advise/transfer-courses>.

This advising recommendation becomes effective July 1, 2005. If changes are made at
either institution, the department chairperson is responsible ~ornotifying the other school.
The recommendation is subject to review every five years from the date of initiation.

Spokane Community College students should follow this advising recommendation closely in
order to fulfill Washington State University and Political Science departmental/Criminal
Justice program requirements, and to complete the AA degree.
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